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PUBLIC NOTICE
MINUTES OF THE ALLAMAKEE 

COUNTY BOARD OF 
SUPERVISORS MONDAY,  

JULY 18, 2022 (UNOFFICIAL)
Board members present: Byrnes, 

Reiser and Schellhammer. All mem-
bers voting “AYE” unless noted.

Meeting called to order by Schell-
hammer, followed by the Pledge of 
Allegiance.

22.261-Motion Byrnes/Second 
Reiser to approve today’s agenda 
and minutes from July 11, 2022. 
Motion carried.

The following people were pres-
ent at various times throughout 
the meeting in person: Lissa Blake 
– Waukon Standard, Denise Beyer 
– Auditor and Clerk to Supervisors, 
Dave Monserud, Heather Bente, 
Sandy Lloyd, Detra Dettmann 
and Bruce Blair with DNR, Dennis 
Blocker, Val Reinke, Clark Mellick.

Public Comment: Detra Dettmann 
and Bruce Blair with DNR were 
present to address some things 
about the Yellow River State For-
est. Their interpretation from their 
bureau of the new legislation is that 
ATVs are allowed to go through 
YRSF on through-roads, but not 
allowed on roads contained within 
the YRSF, such as through camp-
grounds. The campgrounds are 
the state “park” portion of the State 
Forest. Sandy Lloyd commented 
that signage is already up at the 
campsites. Val Reinke gave event 
update including the Star City Film 
Festival and Lansing and Waukon 
RAGBRAI meetings. 

Heather Bente, City Clerk and Li-
brarian, reviewed Waterville events 
and library events, and thanked the 
Supervisors for their support of the 
libraries. Dave Monserud, Mayor, 
gave a report on the School Com-
munity Center building and events 
held there, grants and a new build-
ing going up downtown.

Auditor Beyer gave balances in 
the Partially Self Funded checking 
account and money market ac-
counts and requested permission 
to move funds from the checking to 
the interest earning money market. 

22.262-Motion Byrnes/Second 
Reiser to approve Auditor Beyer 
moving $200,000.00 from WSB 
Checking to Freedom Money Mar-
ket account. Motion carried.

22.263-Motion Reiser/Second 
Byrnes to accept and place on file 
the MMP update for Chestnut Farm 
Site 2. Motion carried.

Attorney Gericke recommended 
setting a public hearing to repeal 
the ATV/UTV Ordinance.

22.264-Motion Reiser/Second 
Byrnes to set August 1 at 9:40 for 
public hearing for repealing ATV/
UTV Ordinance. Motion carried.

Attorney Gericke has been con-
tacted by Fayette County Attorney’s 
office to help with their juvenile 
court caseload. Fayette County At-
torney is retiring and their assistant 
is taking a different job. Jill Kistler 
has agreed to temporarily fill in for 
Fayette juvenile cases. Fayette 
County will compensate Kistler for 
her mileage and duties, starting 
August 8, at 10 hours/week on av-
erage and provide office space for 

her for case preparation. Attorney 
Gericke does not see this affecting 
Kistler’s time with Allamakee. No 
action taken until paperwork is re-
ceived from Fayette County.

Supervisor Schellhammer ex-
plained that Winneshiek Energy 
District is working with Lansing as 
the pending closure of the Lansing 
power plant approaches. They are 
seeking a letter of support from 
Supervisors regarding the Empow-
ering Allamakee County application 
for funding via the USDAs Rural En-
ergy Pilot Program (REPP). 

22.265-Motion Reiser/Second 
Byrnes to sign the letter of support 
for the Empowering Allamakee 
County application. Motion carried.

Jon Luchsinger provided informa-
tion regarding replacing the Meeting 
Owl in the Board room. Supervisors 
are in agreement to pay the insur-
ance deductible and replace the 
Owl until new Audio/Visual equip-
ment is installed and then the Owl 
can be used in another meeting 
room.

Department Head updates: Sheriff 
Mellick has received a map of the 
roads that ATVs are allowed on in 
YRSF, provided by DNR. Sheriff 
Mellick also commented that he 
would like to see children restrained 
and wearing helmets on ATV and 
UTV vehicles for safety, regardless 
of the new legislation not requiring 
it. Auditor Beyer commented that 
she will be working on preparing 
tax statements over the next couple 
weeks.

Engineer Ridenour presented 
bids for repair of English Bench 
watershed Site 9. Nine contractors 
took out plans and proposals with 
just one bid being received. The 
bid bond envelope is unsealed 
and empty. Bids are not allowed 
to be opened unless the bid bond 
is included, so this bid remained 
unopened. Ridenour recommends 
talking to County Attorney on how 
to proceed. No late bids will be al-
lowed by other contractors.

22.266-Motion Byrnes/Second 
Reiser to table the opening of bids 
until next week. Motion carried.

Quotes for LP were reviewed: 
Ag-Vantage FS - $1.65/gallon; 
Consolidated Energy - $1.74/gal-
lon; Waukon Feed Ranch - $1.699/
gallon; Welch, Inc. - $1.74/gallon. 
Engineer Ridenour recommends 
accepting low bid from Ag-Vantage 
FS.

22.267-Motion Reiser/Second 
Byrnes to accept bid from Ag-Van-
tage FS at $1.65/gallon for FY23. 
Motion carried.

22.268-Motion Byrnes/Second 
Reiser to set letting date of August 8 
at 10:00am for concrete pavement 
patching. Motion carried.

Ridenour gave department and 
project updates. 

22.269-Motion Byrnes/Second 
Reiser to adjourn. Motion carried.

Larry Schellhammer, Chairperson
ATTEST:

Denise Beyer, Auditor

Published July 27, 2022 in the 
Postville Herald.

THE IOWA DISTRICT 
COURT ALLAMAKEE COUNTY 

IN THE	 )	 CASE NO. 
MATTER OF 	 )	 ESPR014817
THE ESTATE	 )	 NOTICE OF
OF	 )	 PROBATE OF
OPAL M.	 )	 WILL, OF
COLVIN,	 )	 APPOINTMENT
Deceased.	 )	OF EXECUTOR,
	 )	 AND NOTICE
	 )	TO CREDITORS
To All Persons Interested in the Es-
tate of Opal M. Colvin, Deceased, 
who died on or about January 22, 
2021:

You are hereby notified that on 
June 30, 2022, the Last Will and 
Testament of Opal M. Colvin, de-
ceased, bearing date of September 
18, 2014 was admitted to probate 
in the above named court and that 
Barbara Friederich was appointed 
Executor of the estate. Any action to 
set aside the will must be brought in 
the district court of said county with-
in the later to occur of four months 
from the date of the second publica-
tion of this notice or one month from 
the date of mailing of this notice to 
all heirs of the decedent and devi-
sees under the will whose identities 

are reasonably ascertainable, or 
thereafter be forever barred.

Notice is further given that all 
persons indebted to the estate are 
requested to make immediate pay-
ment to the undersigned, and cred-
itors having claims against the es-
tate shall tile them with the clerk of 
the above named district court, as 
provided by law, duly authenticated, 
for allowance, and unless so filed 
by the later to occur of four months 
from the date of the second publica-
tion of this notice or one month from 
the date of mailing of this notice 
(unless otherwise allowed or paid) 
a claim is thereafter forever barred.

Dated June 30, 2022.
/s/ Barbara Friederich,

Executor of Estate 
584 Hardin Drive

Postville, IA 52162

/s/ Matthew J. Erickson,
ICIS#: AT0002419
Attorney for Executor 

Date of second publication Au-
gust 3, 2022.

Published July 27 and August 3, 
2022 in the Postville Herald.

PUBLIC NOTICE

PUBLIC NOTICE
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

REGARDING REPEAL OF 
ORDINANCE NO. LV 

The Allamakee County Board of 
Supervisors will hold a public hear-
ing Monday, August 1, 2022 at 9:40 
A.M., to hear comments regarding 
the repeal of Ordinance LV – Reg-
ulations Regarding All-Terrain Vehi-
cles or Off-Road Utility Vehicles on 
Secondary Roads.

The public hearing will be held 
during the Board of Supervisors 

meeting in the Board of Supervisors 
room at 110 Allamakee St, Waukon, 
IA 52172.  The full language of Ordi-
nance LV to be repealed is available 
in the Auditor’s office at 110 Allama-
kee Street, Waukon.

Dated the 27th day of July, 2022. 
Denise Beyer, Allamakee County 
Auditor

Published July 27, 2022 in the 
Postville Herald.


